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Abstract

This paper describes about introduction to accommodation, it components, factors and its treatment modalities.
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Introduction
Accommodation is a condition where parallel rays of light are 

coming from near object and brought to focus on the foveal area 
by changing the anterior surface of the crystalline lens. It is a triad 
mechanism. i.e. (Accommodation + Convergence + Pupil constric-
tion). It is called Synkinesis also.

E.g. When patient is looking at a distance object usually at 
6-meter distance, then accommodation does not play role. When 
patient is looking at 40 cm at that time accommodation plays role.

During accommodation, ciliary muscle contracts and suspen-
sory ligament is in relax condition.

With increasing age, the elasticity of the crystalline lens is re-
duced that’s why lens is getting problem to bulge.

Components of accommodation 

1. Reflex accommodation 

2. Vergence accommodation 

3. Proximal accommodation 

4. Toxic accommodation. 

Reflex accommodation 

It is an automatic mechanism. Up to 2.00 D patient is able to 
control it (Monocular/binocular). Reflex accommodation is the 
most important component of accommodation. 

Vergence accommodation 

It is induced by fusional convergence. It means during fusion 
when eye converges then accommodation is stimulated which will 
induce CA/C ratio.

Proximal accommodation 

It occurs due to nearness of an object at 3m distance. 

Toxic accommodation 

Toxic accommodation is created without blur. When patient sits 
in the dark room away from the wall at 3 m then it is stimulated. 
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In this situation, biochemical composition of the crystalline lens is 
changed. With increase in age toxic accommodation is reduced.

Factors:

• Far point

• Near point

• Range of accommodation 

• Amplitude of accommodation. 

By the Hoffster's formula we can able to know the amplitude of 
accommodation.

18.5 - Age/3.

Always it is remembered that with increase in age amplitude of 
accommodation is changed and up to 2 D it is tolerable.

In some specific reasons, changes in accommodation are found 
which is called anomalous of accommodation. 

They are: 

• Insufficiency of accommodation

• Excess of accommodation 

• Infacility of accommodation. 

In all the above cases, amplitude of accommodation is changed 
up to 2.00 D.

These abnormalities of accommodation can be treated with vi-
sion therapy and meditation also [1-3].
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